

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611

Irvine
(949) 263-2600

Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100

Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584

Sacramento
(916) 325-4000

San Diego
(619) 525-1300

Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300

Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

TOWN OF APPLE VALLEY
ATTN: LA VONDA PEARSON
14955 DALE EVANS PARKWAY
APPLE VALLEY, CA 92307-3061

May 3, 2019
Invoice 848316
JEB
Page 1

INVOICE SUMMARY

For Professional Services Rendered Through April 30, 2019:

Our Matter # 28314.00255

Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

Current Fees:	\$	99,853.90
Current Reimbursable Costs:		25,113.39
Total Current Billings For This Matter:	\$	<u>124,967.29</u>

INVOICE IS DUE AND PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584
Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
Invoice 848316
Page 2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/01/19	REVIEW [REDACTED] REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; COORDINATE [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ MR. BURKE, ASSISTANT TOWN ENGINEER; REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; COMMENCE WORK ON [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	4.20
04/01/19	TCALL FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: JAMES B. GILPIN	0.30
04/01/19	REVISE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] OF COUNSEL: GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	3.70
04/01/19	EMAIL COMMUNICATION TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; UPDATE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM PARALEGAL MCCOY [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; UPDATE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW AND ASSEMBLE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY [REDACTED] [REDACTED] EMAIL COMMUNICATION TO DIRECTOR OF PRACTICE SUPPORT ORNELAS RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; RESEARCH [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; MEETING WITH ATTY MACVEY [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: MARVIN I. COHEN	8.00

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584
Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
Invoice 848316
Page 3

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/01/19	O/CONF W/ ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED]; PREPARE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	1.10
04/01/19	TEL CONF W/ [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; SCHEDULE CONF CALL W/ [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	0.80
04/01/19	PREPARE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] LIT ANALYST: WILLIAM KING	0.30
04/02/19	CONFERENCE WITH MR. BURKE, ASSISTANT TOWN ENGINEER, RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ MS.LAMSON RE [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	5.10
04/02/19	TCALL FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: JAMES B. GILPIN	0.10
04/02/19	MEETING WITH ATTY RICE RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: CAROL L. SWANSON	0.20
04/02/19	CORRESPONDENCE WITH Y. RIVERA RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] RECEIVE AND BEGIN REVIEW OF [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	3.60
04/02/19	REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	0.50
04/02/19	T/CONF W/ CLIENT [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: CHRISTOPHER PISANO	2.00

Indian Wells
 (760) 568-2611
 Irvine
 (949) 263-2600
 Los Angeles
 (213) 617-8100
 Manhattan Beach
 (310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
 ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
 Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
 Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
 (909) 989-8584
 Sacramento
 (916) 325-4000
 San Diego
 (619) 525-1300
 Walnut Creek
 (925) 977-3300
 Washington DC
 (202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
 Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
 Invoice 848316
 Page 4

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/02/19	MEET AND CONFER CORRESPONDENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL GEORGE SONEFF RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED], T/CONF W/ LORI LAMSON RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED], REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVISE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] OF COUNSEL: GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	4.30
04/02/19	CONFIRM [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; ASSEMBLE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; ASSEMBLE [REDACTED]; MEET WITH ATTY MACVEY, [REDACTED] AND PARALEGAL MCCOY TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; UPDATE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: MARVIN I. COHEN	2.80
04/02/19	ATTEND MEETING W/ [REDACTED] AND REVIEW AND DISCUSS [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	0.90
04/02/19	PREPARE AND ORGANIZE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] LIT ANALYST: JUAN ORNELAS	1.20
04/02/19	DOCKET THREE DEPOSITIONS IN APRIL AND MAY; CALCULATE DEADLINES; GENERATE REPORT [REDACTED] ADMIN. ASST.: DAVID ROSENFELD	0.30
04/03/19	DRAFT AND CIRCULATE [REDACTED]; DRAFT AND CIRCULATE [REDACTED]; COORDINATE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCES RE SAME; PREPARE [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCE RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; T/CONFS W/ [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCE RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	3.80

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER LLP
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584
Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
Invoice 848316
Page 5

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/03/19	TCALL TO ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: JAMES B. GILPIN	0.20
04/03/19	FINALIZE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: GREGORY G. SNARR	2.20
04/03/19	T/CONF AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED], REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED], CORRESPONDENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL GEORGE SONEFF RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED], FINALIZE AND SERVE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] OF COUNSEL: GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	3.80
04/03/19	EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; T/CALL FROM PARALEGAL SWANSON RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CREATE [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED]; ASSEMBLE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ PARALEGAL MCCOY RE [REDACTED]; BEGIN REVIEW OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: MARVIN I. COHEN	3.00
04/03/19	EMAIL TO AND CONFERENCES WITH ATTY RICE RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ PARALEGAL M. COHEN RE SAME; BEGIN PREPARATION OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: CAROL L. SWANSON	1.20
04/03/19	REVIEW [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	0.70
04/03/19	DOCKET; OBJECTIONS AND NOTICE OF DEPOSITIONS; CALCULATE DEADLINES; CREATE REPORTS [REDACTED] ADMIN. ASST.: MICHAEL C. HERNDS	0.20

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611

Irvine
(949) 263-2600

Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100

Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584

Sacramento
(916) 325-4000

San Diego
(619) 525-1300

Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300

Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
Invoice 848316
Page 6

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/04/19	T/CONFS W/ [REDACTED]; LEGAL RESEARCH RE [REDACTED]; [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCES RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	2.50
04/04/19	TCALL FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: JAMES B. GILPIN	0.50
04/04/19	DISCUSS [REDACTED] [REDACTED] W/ ATTY MACVEY PARTNER: CHARITY B. SCHILLER	0.30
04/04/19	EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; ASSEMBLE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; UPDATE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; PREPARE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; UPDATE [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION TO ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONTINUE REVIEW OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: MARVIN I. COHEN	6.80
04/04/19	BEGIN REVIEW OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	4.50
04/05/19	TEAM MEETING; REVIEW [REDACTED]; PREPARE [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCES [REDACTED]; T/CONFS W/ [REDACTED]; [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ [REDACTED]; LEGAL RESEARCH RE [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCE RE SAME; CONTINUE [REDACTED]; CONTINUE WITH [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	4.70
04/05/19	PARTICIPATE IN [REDACTED] MEETING PARTNER: GREGORY G. SNARR	0.70

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584
Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
Invoice 848316
Page 7

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/05/19	T/CONF RE [REDACTED] ASSOCIATE: MATTHEW B. GRACE	0.50 NO CHARGE
04/05/19	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND WEEKLY LITIGATION MEETING RE [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	0.60
04/05/19	E-MAILS W/ ATTY RICE AND T/CONF W/ ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] OF COUNSEL: WILLIAM J. PRIEST	0.70
04/05/19	ATTEND WEEKLY TEAM CONFERENCE CALL MEETING WITH ATTYS MACVEY, FRIAS, SNARR, PISANO, GRACE AND PARALEGAL MCCOY; CONTINUE REVIEW OF [REDACTED]; ASSEMBLE [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: MARVIN I. COHEN	2.80
04/05/19	CONTINUE REVIEW OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	3.40
04/08/19	REVIEW [REDACTED]; CORRESPOND WITH ATTY MACVEY RE SAME ASSOCIATE: THOMAS RICE	0.10
04/08/19	TEL CONF W/ [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	0.80
04/08/19	T/CONF W/ [REDACTED] T/CONF W/ MR. BURKE; T/CONF W/ [REDACTED] REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCES RE [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCE RE [REDACTED]; FINALIZE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	4.20

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611

Irvine
(949) 263-2600

Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100

Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584

Sacramento
(916) 325-4000

San Diego
(619) 525-1300

Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300

Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255

Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019

Invoice 848316

Page 8

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/08/19	MEET AND CONFER CORRESPONDENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL GEORGE SONEFF RE [REDACTED], REVIEW [REDACTED], REVISE [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] OF COUNSEL: GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	3.20
04/08/19	UPDATE [REDACTED] T/CALL TO J. ORNELAS RE [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED]; PERFORM [REDACTED]; CONTINUE REVIEW OF [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: MARVIN I. COHEN	4.40
04/08/19	REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF [REDACTED]; CREATE [REDACTED]; BEGIN DRAFT [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: CAROL L. SWANSON	1.40
04/08/19	CONTINUE REVIEW [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	2.20
04/09/19	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. HENDERSON; INTRA O/CONFERENCE RE [REDACTED]; COORDINATE RE [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED]; EXCHANGE EMAILS WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	3.40
04/09/19	TCALL ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: JAMES B. GILPIN	0.20
04/09/19	FINALIZE [REDACTED], CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING COUNSEL GEORGE SONEFF AND DAVID MORAN RE SAME, REVIEW [REDACTED] AND REVIEW [REDACTED] OF COUNSEL: GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	3.60

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584
Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
Invoice 848316
Page 9

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/09/19	RESEARCH [REDACTED]; CONTINUE REVIEW OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: MARVIN I. COHEN	7.20
04/09/19	FINALIZE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONTINUE TO CREATE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; FINALIZE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL TO ATTY RICE RE SAME PARALEGAL: CAROL L. SWANSON	1.80
04/09/19	TEL CONF W/ L LAMSON RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	0.60
04/09/19	EMAIL FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	0.70
04/09/19	DOCKET 4-1-19 TOWN SUBPOENAS FOR 5-1-19 PRODUCTION; CALCULATE DEADLINE; GENERATE REPORT [REDACTED] ADMIN. ASST.: DAVID ROSENFELD	0.10
04/09/19	DOCKET 5-10-19 DEPOSITION OF PMK OF LIBERTY; CALCULATE DEADLINES; GENERATE REPORT [REDACTED] ADMIN. ASST.: DAVID ROSENFELD	0.10
04/10/19	T/CONF W/ MR. BURKE; T/CONF W/ [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED]; BEGIN PREPARATION [REDACTED]; PREPARE [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCE RE [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCE RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCE RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	3.80
04/10/19	CONFERENCE CALL WITH KEN MACVEY AND [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: JAMES B. GILPIN	0.60
04/10/19	TCALL FROM ATTY MACVEY [REDACTED] PARTNER: JAMES B. GILPIN	0.30

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584
Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
Invoice 848316
Page 10

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/10/19	INTRA O/CONF W/ ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: CHARITY B. SCHILLER	0.30
04/10/19	REVIEW AND ANALYZE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: CHRISTOPHER PISANO	1.60
04/10/19	DISCUSSIONS W/ OPPOSING COUNSEL RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: GREGORY G. SNARR	0.30
04/10/19	CONTINUE REVIEW OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; ATTEND [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; ASSEMBLE [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION TO ATTY PISANO [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; ASSEMBLE [REDACTED] DRAFT [REDACTED]; PREPARE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ASSEMBLE [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION TO ATTY GILPIN [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: MARVIN I. COHEN	5.90
04/10/19	CONTINUE REVIEW AND COLLECTION OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONTINUE REVIEW OF [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	4.00
04/10/19	DOCKET TWO DEPOSITIONS FOR LIBERTY PMQ FOR 4/16/19 AND 4/22/19; CALCULATE DEADLINES; GENERATE REPORT [REDACTED] ADMIN. ASST.: DAVID ROSENFELD	0.20
04/11/19	INTRA O/CONFERENCES RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	0.40
04/11/19	TEL CALL W/ L LAMSON RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	0.60
04/11/19	CONTINUE REVIEW AND COLLECTION OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	5.50

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584
Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
Invoice 848316
Page 11

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/11/19	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; ASSEMBLE AND ORGANIZE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: MARVIN I. COHEN	5.50
04/12/19	TEAM MEETING; REVIEW [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCES RE [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ [REDACTED] T/CONF W/ GREG SNYDER; REVIEW AND INTRA O/CONFERENCES RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	3.60
04/12/19	CONFERENCE CALL WITH ATTY SCHILLER RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: JAMES B. GILPIN	0.50
04/12/19	T/CONF W/ ATTY GILPIN RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: CHARITY B. SCHILLER	0.30
04/12/19	CONFERENCE CALL WITH [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: CHRISTOPHER PISANO	0.40
04/12/19	PARTICIPATE IN [REDACTED] MEETING PARTNER: GREGORY G. SNARR	0.50
04/12/19	LEGAL RESEARCH AND E-MAIL MEMO TO ATTYS MACVEY AND RICE RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] OF COUNSEL: WILLIAM J. PRIEST	1.60
04/12/19	CORRESPONDENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL GEORGE SONEFF AND DAVID MORAN RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] OF COUNSEL: GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	4.20

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER LLP
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584
Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
Invoice 848316
Page 12

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	
04/12/19	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN TEAM [REDACTED] CALL; MEET WITH ATTY EGGER AND ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED]; MEET WITH ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED]; PREPARE [REDACTED] RE SAME ASSOCIATE: THOMAS RICE	1.50	
04/12/19	T/CONF RE [REDACTED] ASSOCIATE: MATTHEW B. GRACE	0.50	NO CHARGE
04/12/19	ATTEND WEEKLY TEAM CONFERENCE CALL MEETING WITH ATTYS MACVEY, FRIAS, GRACE, PISANO, RICE, SNARR AND PARALEGAL MCCOY; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED]; CONTINUE REVIEW OF [REDACTED]; ASSEMBLE [REDACTED]; [REDACTED]; [REDACTED]; [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: MARVIN I. COHEN	5.80	
04/12/19	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND WEEKLY [REDACTED] MEETING RE [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	1.10	
04/12/19	CONTINUE REVIEW AND COLLECTION OF [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	2.30	
04/12/19	LEGAL RESEARCH [REDACTED] RESEARCH ANALYS: ERIN MURPHY	0.40	
04/13/19	PREPARATION FOR [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	0.60	
04/15/19	CONFERENCE CALL WITH MR. BURKE RE [REDACTED] INTRA O/CONFERENCE RE [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCES RE [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ [REDACTED]; TELEPHONE OCNFERENCES WITH MR. [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ [REDACTED], [REDACTED] REVIEW [REDACTED] REVIEW AND PREPARE [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	7.90	

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611

Irvine
(949) 263-2600

Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100

Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER LLP
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584

Sacramento
(916) 325-4000

San Diego
(619) 525-1300

Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300

Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255

Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019

Invoice 848316

Page 13

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/15/19	CONFERENCE CALL WITH ATTY MACVEY AND [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED]; TCALL TO ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] PARTNER: JAMES B. GILPIN	2.40
04/15/19	REVIEW [REDACTED] PARTNER: KIM A. BYRENS	0.50
04/15/19	REVIEW [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] OF COUNSEL: GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	1.70
04/15/19	RESEARCH AND ASSEMBLE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; RECEIVE AND REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY [REDACTED] [REDACTED] RECEIVE AND REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; RECEIVE AND REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; RECEIVE AND REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; RECEIVE AND REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: MARVIN I. COHEN	4.50
04/15/19	DOCKET 5-14-19 TO 5-16-19 - THREE DEPOSITIONS OF TOWN OF APPLE VALLEY; CALCULATE DEADLINES; GENERATE REPORT [REDACTED] ADMIN. ASST.: DAVID ROSENFELD	0.40
04/16/19	PREPARE FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH [REDACTED] RE SAME AND [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCE RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; COMMENCE REVIEW RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	7.80
04/16/19	REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND DRAFT [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED] OF COUNSEL: GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	3.70

Indian Wells
 (760) 568-2611
 Irvine
 (949) 263-2600
 Los Angeles
 (213) 617-8100
 Manhattan Beach
 (310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
 ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
 Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
 Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
 (909) 989-8584
 Sacramento
 (916) 325-4000
 San Diego
 (619) 525-1300
 Walnut Creek
 (925) 977-3300
 Washington DC
 (202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
 Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
 Invoice 848316
 Page 14

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/16/19	CONTINUE REVIEW AND COLLECTION OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	3.30
04/16/19	ASSEMBLE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ASSEMBLE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; PREPARE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; PREPARE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; UPDATE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTYS MACVEY AND PRIEST RE [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION TO ATTY MACVEY [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONTINUE REVIEW OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: MARVIN I. COHEN	6.90
04/17/19	EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM J. ORNELAS RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW, ASSEMBLE AND ORGANIZE [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION TO ATTYS MACVEY AND PISANO [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] ATTEND MEETING WITH ATTY RICE AND PARALEGAL MCCOY RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: MARVIN I. COHEN	5.40
04/17/19	O/CONF W/ ATTY RICE RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONTINUE REVIEW AND COLLECTION OF [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	2.40
04/17/19	REVIEW AND INTRA O/CONFERENCES RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCES RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONTINUE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	6.50
04/17/19	REVIEW AND ANALYZE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] RE SAME PARTNER: CHRISTOPHER PISANO	1.30

Indian Wells
 (760) 568-2611
 Irvine
 (949) 263-2600
 Los Angeles
 (213) 617-8100
 Manhattan Beach
 (310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
 ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
 Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
 Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
 (909) 989-8584
 Sacramento
 (916) 325-4000
 San Diego
 (619) 525-1300
 Walnut Creek
 (925) 977-3300
 Washington DC
 (202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
 Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
 Invoice 848316
 Page 15

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/17/19	RESEARCH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: BRITTANY REESE	1.00
04/18/19	WORK W/ ATTY MACVEY TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: CHARITY B. SCHILLER	0.30
04/18/19	T/CONF W/ CLIENT RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: CHRISTOPHER PISANO	1.30
04/18/19	REVIEW [REDACTED]; CONTINUE TO REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] PREPARE FOR [REDACTED] T/CONF W/ OPPOSING COUNSEL RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ MS. LAMSON RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; PREPARE [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED]; PREPARE [REDACTED] RE SAME PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	7.90
04/18/19	PHONE CONFERENCE WITH LORI LAMSON RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] OF COUNSEL: GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	1.80
04/18/19	CONTINUE RESEARCH ON [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONTINUE RESEARCH ON [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	4.80
04/18/19	REVIEW, ASSEMBLE AND ORGANIZE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: MARVIN I. COHEN	3.40
04/18/19	AUDIT [REDACTED] [REDACTED] LIT ANALYST: JUAN ORNELAS	0.80
04/19/19	CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: CHRISTOPHER PISANO	0.80

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584
Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
Invoice 848316
Page 16

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/19/19	TEAM MEETING; REVIEW [REDACTED] AND PREPARE FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] RE SAME PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	[REDACTED]
04/19/19	DRAFT [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] OF COUNSEL: GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	3.00
04/19/19	EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ATTEND WEEKLY TEAM CONFERENCE CALL MEETING WITH ATTYS MACVEY, FRIAS, PISANO, RICE AND PARALEGAL MCCOY; RESEARCH [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; ASSEMBLE AND ORGANIZE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION TO [REDACTED]; UPDATE [REDACTED] EMAIL COMMUNICATION TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; UPDATE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: MARVIN I. COHEN	5.70
04/19/19	ATTEND WEEKLY LITIGATION MEETING W/ ATTYS RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONTINUE REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	4.30
04/19/19	O/ CONF W/ ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	0.40
04/20/19	REVIEW [REDACTED]; CONTINUE PREPARATION FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	1.50
04/22/19	PREPARE FOR AND TAKE DEPOSITION OF [REDACTED]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH [REDACTED] RE SAME PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	7.60

Indian Wells
 (760) 568-2611
 Irvine
 (949) 263-2600
 Los Angeles
 (213) 617-8100
 Manhattan Beach
 (310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER LP
 ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
 Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
 Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
 (909) 989-8584
 Sacramento
 (916) 325-4000
 San Diego
 (619) 525-1300
 Walnut Creek
 (925) 977-3300
 Washington DC
 (202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
 Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
 Invoice 848316
 Page 17

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/22/19	DRAFT [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] OF COUNSEL: GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	3.40
04/22/19	RECEIVE AND REVIEW [REDACTED]; SET UP [REDACTED]; RESEARCH [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONTINUE REVIEW OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: MARVIN I. COHEN	3.50
04/22/19	CONTINUE REVIEW AND RESEARCH FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	3.90
04/23/19	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH [REDACTED]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH [REDACTED] TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCES RE [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCES [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCE AND REVIEW RE [REDACTED]; PREPARE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	3.50
04/23/19	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: CHRISTOPHER PISANO	0.90

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER LLP
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584
Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
Invoice 848316
Page 18

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/23/19	EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] WITH [REDACTED] UPDATE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY PISANO RE [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; RECEIVE AND ORGANIZE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; RECEIVE AND ORGANIZE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; UPDATE [REDACTED]; RESEARCH [REDACTED]; ASSEMBLE [REDACTED] EMAIL COMMUNICATION TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; UPDATE [REDACTED] PREPARE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; PREPARE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: MARVIN I. COHEN	5.30
04/23/19	REVIEW [REDACTED]; CONTINUE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONTINUE [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	5.20
04/23/19	DRAFT [REDACTED] AND REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED] OF COUNSEL: GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	5.20
04/24/19	INTRA O/CONFERENCES RE [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCE AND REVIEW RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCES RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	1.10
04/24/19	REVISE [REDACTED] [REDACTED], REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED], AND REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED] OF COUNSEL: GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	2.30
04/24/19	REVIEW OF [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; RESEARCH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	3.70

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584
Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
Invoice 848316
Page 19

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/24/19	RESEARCH [REDACTED] AND DRAFT [REDACTED] RE SAME; REMIT SAME TO ATTYS RICE AND MACVEY PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	1.10
04/24/19	CONTINUE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	1.10
04/25/19	CORRESPONDENCE W/ [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ASSOCIATE: JESSICA LOMAKIN	0.30
04/25/19	REVIEW [REDACTED]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED]; PREPARE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCES RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	4.30
04/25/19	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW AND REVISE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: CHRISTOPHER PISANO	6.40
04/25/19	MEETING WITH [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW AND REVISE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL GEORGE SONEFF RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING COUNSEL GEORGE SONEFF RE SAME OF COUNSEL: GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	6.50
04/25/19	CONTINUE REVIEW OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONTINUE REVIEW OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	2.40

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584
Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
Invoice 848316
Page 20

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/25/19	PREPARE AND ORGANIZE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] LIT ANALYST: JUAN ORNELAS	1.50
04/26/19	TEAM MEETING; INTRA O/CONFERENCES RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCE RE [REDACTED]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCES RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	6.20
04/26/19	CONF W/ ATTYS MACVEY AND PISANO RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: RICHARD T. EGGER	0.30
04/26/19	REVIEW [REDACTED]; BEGIN [REDACTED] PARTNER: CHARITY B. SCHILLER	0.60
04/26/19	CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: CHRISTOPHER PISANO	0.80
04/26/19	REVISE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH OPPOSING GEORGE SONOFF RE [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH LORI LAMSON RE SAME; REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED] OF COUNSEL: GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	5.70
04/26/19	O/CONF W/ ATTYS RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	0.80

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584
Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
Invoice 848316
Page 21

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/26/19	PREPARE [REDACTED]; DRAFT [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	2.10
04/26/19	REVISE [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	0.50
04/26/19	DRAFT [REDACTED] RE PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	0.40
04/26/19	PREPARE AND ORGANIZE [REDACTED]; PREPARE AND ORGANIZE [REDACTED] LIT ANALYST: JUAN ORNELAS	3.00
04/26/19	EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM FEDEX CONFIRMING DELIVERY OF OVERNIGHT MAIL TO [REDACTED] EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY FRIAS [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY FRIAS RE [REDACTED]; RECEIVE AND REVIEW [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS FROM ATTY RICE [REDACTED]; MEET WITH J. ORNELAS RE [REDACTED]; ATTEND WEEKLY TEAM CONFERENCE CALL MEETING WITH ATTYS MACVEY, PISANO, FRIAS, RICE AND PARALEGAL MCCOY; RESEARCH [REDACTED]; ASSEMBLE [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: MARVIN I. COHEN	5.50
04/29/19	INTRA O/CONFERENCE RE [REDACTED]; PREPARE [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCES RE [REDACTED]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCES RE SAME AND [REDACTED]; PREPARE [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	4.90

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER LLP
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584
Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
Invoice 848316
Page 22

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/29/19	FINISH REVIEW OF [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ ATTYS GILPIN AND MACVEY RE SAME; EMAILS RE SAME PARTNER: CHARITY B. SCHILLER	1.00
04/29/19	MEET AND CONFER CORRESPONDENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL GEORGE SONEFF AND DAVID MORAN RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED], REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS RE [REDACTED] OF COUNSEL: GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	2.70
04/29/19	EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY RICE RE [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM J. ORNEALS [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] REVIEW [REDACTED]; BRIEF MEETING WITH ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED]; ASSEMBLE [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION TO [REDACTED]; CREATE [REDACTED]; CREATE [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: MARVIN I. COHEN	5.70
04/29/19	CONFERENCE CALL WITH ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: JAMES B. GILPIN	0.30
04/29/19	CONFERENCE CALL WITH ATTYS MACVEY AND SCHILLER RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: JAMES B. GILPIN	0.80
04/29/19	T/CONF W/ ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] CORRESPOND WITH [REDACTED] RE SAME; CORRESPOND WITH ATTY MACVEY RE SAME ASSOCIATE: THOMAS RICE	0.30

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER LLP
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584
Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
Invoice 848316
Page 23

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/29/19	O CONF W/ ATTYS RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	0.30
04/29/19	PREPARE AND ORGANIZE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] LIT ANALYST: WILLIAM KING	0.50
04/30/19	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND [REDACTED] PARTNER: CHRISTOPHER PISANO	8.20
04/30/19	[REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] LIT ANALYST: KYLE A. DAVIDSON	0.40
04/30/19	DOCKET; DEPOSITION; CALCULATE DEADLINES; CREATE REPORT [REDACTED] ADMIN. ASST.: MICHAEL C. HERNDS	0.20
04/30/19	EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM W. KING RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ADDITIONAL REVIEW OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; TELEPHONE CALL TO [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED]; LEFT DETAILED MESSAGE; EMAIL COMMUNICATION TO ATTY PISANO [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; ASSEMBLE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM PARALEGAL MCCOY RE [REDACTED]; EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; RESEARCH AND FORWARD TO PARALEGAL MCCOY [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; RECEIVE AND REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONTINUE REVIEW OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REVIEW AND ASSEMBLE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: MARVIN I. COHEN	4.90

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER LLP
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584
Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
Invoice 848316
Page 24

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/30/19	CONTINUE REVIEW OF [REDACTED]; PREPARE [REDACTED]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED] REVISE [REDACTED]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] RE SAME; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFERENCE RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	5.80
04/30/19	EMAILS RE [REDACTED]; OUTREACH TO [REDACTED] RE SAME PARTNER: CHARITY B. SCHILLER	0.40
04/30/19	AMEND [REDACTED]; DRAFT [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] OF COUNSEL: GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	3.40
04/30/19	REVIEW [REDACTED]; O/ CONF W/ ATTY MACVEY RE [REDACTED]; FINALIZE AND PROCESS [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: HEATHER MCCOY	2.10

Summary of Fees:

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hr</u>	<u>Amount</u>
KENDALL H. MACVEY	PARTNER	108.80	321.00	34,924.80
JAMES B. GILPIN	PARTNER	6.20	321.00	1,990.20
KIM A. BYRENS	PARTNER	0.50	321.00	160.50
RICHARD T. EGGER	PARTNER	0.30	321.00	96.30
GREGORY G. SNARR	PARTNER	3.70	321.00	1,187.70
CHARITY B. SCHILLER	PARTNER	3.20	321.00	1,027.20
CHRISTOPHER PISANO	PARTNER	23.70	321.00	7,607.70
WILLIAM J. PRIEST	OF COUNSEL	2.30	311.00	715.30
GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	OF COUNSEL	62.20	311.00	19,344.20
THOMAS RICE	ASSOCIATE	1.90	282.00	535.80
JESSICA LOMAKIN	ASSOCIATE	0.30	282.00	84.60
DAVID ROSENFELD	ADMIN. ASST.	1.10	114.00	125.40
MATTHEW B. GRACE	ASSOCIATE	0.00	0.00	0.00
KYLE A. DAVIDSON	LIT ANALYST	0.40	169.00	67.60
WILLIAM KING	LIT ANALYST	0.80	169.00	135.20

Privileged and Confidential

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584
Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
Invoice 848316
Page 25

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hr</u>	<u>Amount</u>
JUAN ORNELAS	LIT ANALYST	6.50	169.00	1,098.50
MICHAEL C. HERNDS	ADMIN. ASST.	0.40	114.00	45.60
ERIN MURPHY	RESEARCH ANALYS	0.40	169.00	67.60
MARVIN I. COHEN	PARALEGAL	103.00	169.00	17,407.00
CAROL L. SWANSON	PARALEGAL	4.60	169.00	777.40
HEATHER MCCOY	PARALEGAL	72.70	169.00	12,286.30
BRITTANY REESE	PARALEGAL	1.00	169.00	169.00

Total Hours: 404.00

Total Fees for Professional Services \$ 99,853.90

Reimbursable Costs:

DEPOSITION

02/28/19	Reversal from Cancelled Voucher 670773	(1,238.00)
02/28/19	(REVISED) DEPOSITION OF [REDACTED] - ELITE COURT REPORTING (KHM)	1,328.75
03/01/19	TRANSCRIPT OF [REDACTED] - ELITE COURT REPORTING (KHM)	1,659.10
03/12/19	TRANSCRIPT OF [REDACTED] - ELITE COURT REPORTING (KHM)	1,298.85
03/14/19	TRANSCRIPT OF [REDACTED] - ELITE COURT REPORTING (KHM)	2,106.25
	SUBTOTAL:	5,154.95

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

03/30/19	PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH MARCH 30, 2019 [REDACTED] (KHM)	525.00
03/30/19	PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED FROM MARCH 3-30, 2019 - [REDACTED] (KHM)	1,495.00
03/30/19	PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED MARCH 2019 RE [REDACTED] (KHM)	17,520.00
	SUBTOTAL:	19,540.00

SHIPPING

04/01/19	SHIPPING	11.28
04/01/19	SHIPPING	11.28

Privileged and Confidential

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Manhattan Beach
(310) 643-8448



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Ontario
(909) 989-8584
Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.00255
Re: ADV. APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER CO. (EMINENT DOMAIN)

May 3, 2019
Invoice 848316
Page 26

04/01/19	SHIPPING	11.28
04/03/19	SHIPPING	11.28
04/03/19	SHIPPING	11.28
04/03/19	SHIPPING	11.28
04/04/19	SHIPPING	24.50
04/09/19	SHIPPING	11.28
04/09/19	SHIPPING	11.28
04/09/19	SHIPPING	11.28
04/10/19	SHIPPING	22.08
	SUBTOTAL:	148.10
TRAVEL		
02/28/19	MILEAGE, LOS ANGELES TO RIVERSIDE, ATTEND DEPOSITION IN RIVERSIDE OFFICE, 02/28/2019, GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	64.96
03/01/19	MILEAGE, LOS ANGELES TO RIVERSIDE, ATTEND DEPOSITION IN RIVERSIDE OFFICE, 03/01/2019, GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	64.96
03/12/19	MILEAGE, LOS ANGELES TO RIVERSIDE, ATTEND DEPOSITION IN RIVERSIDE OFFICE, 03/12/2019, GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	64.96
03/14/19	MILEAGE, LOS ANGELES TO RIVERSIDE, ATTEND DEPOSITION IN RIVERSIDE OFFICE, 03/14/2019, GUILLERMO A. FRIAS	64.96
	SUBTOTAL:	259.84
04/30/19	POSTAGE	0.50
04/30/19	MULTI-MEDIA DUPLICATION/CD	10.00
	Total Reimbursable Costs	\$ 25,113.39
	Total Current Billings For This Matter:	\$ 124,967.29