

Indian Wells  
(760) 568-2611

Irvine  
(949) 263-2600

Los Angeles  
(213) 617-8100

Ontario  
(800) 989-8584



**BEST BEST & KRIEGER**  
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502  
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com  
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Sacramento  
(916) 325-4000

San Diego  
(619) 525-1300

Walnut Creek  
(925) 977-3300

Washington DC  
(202) 785-0600

TOWN OF APPLE VALLEY  
ATTN: LA VONDA PEARSON  
14955 DALE EVANS PARKWAY  
APPLE VALLEY, CA 92307-3061

July 18, 2014  
Invoice 730100  
JEB  
Page 1

---

**INVOICE SUMMARY**

*For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014:*

Our Matter # 28314.0201A  
Re: APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER COMPANY

Current Fees:	\$ 17,521.90
Current Reimbursable Costs:	8,881.92
	<hr/>
Total Current Billings For This Matter:	\$ 26,403.82
	<hr/>

**INVOICE IS DUE AND PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT**

Indian Wells  
(760) 568-2611

Irvine  
(949) 263-2600

Los Angeles  
(213) 617-8100

Ontario  
(909) 989-8584



**BEST BEST & KRIEGER**  
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502  
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com  
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Sacramento  
(916) 325-4000

San Diego  
(619) 525-1300

Walnut Creek  
(925) 977-3300

Washington DC  
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.0201A  
Re: APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER COMPANY

July 18, 2014  
Invoice 730100  
Page 2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
06/01/14	REVIEW AND ANALYZE [REDACTED]; DRAFT EMAIL SUMMARIZING SAME; ONLINE RESEARCH RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: JASON M. ACKERMAN	3.90
06/02/14	CONTINUE PREPARATION FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: JOHN E. BROWN	0.90
06/02/14	PREPARE [REDACTED]; UPDATE LAWYERS; COMPOSE AND EXCHANGE NUMEROUS E-MAILS [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: JOHN E. BROWN	0.80
06/02/14	INTRA O/CONFS RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	0.70
06/02/14	REVIEW OF ISSUES RE [REDACTED] Y PARTNER: PIERO C. DALLARDA	1.60
06/02/14	FOLLOW-UP EMAIL TO ATTY BROWN RE [REDACTED] E; PREPARE FOR [REDACTED] S; REVIEW AND ANALYZE [REDACTED] S; REVIEW [REDACTED]; EXCHANGE EMAIL [REDACTED] Y; PARTICIPATE IN MEETING W/ ATTYS BROWN, MACVEY AND DALLARDA RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] S PARTNER: JASON M. ACKERMAN	5.60
06/03/14	REVIEW [REDACTED] N [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONFS RE SAME PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	1.20
06/03/14	PREPARE FOR [REDACTED] T [REDACTED]; EMAILS AND T/CONFS; WORK ON [REDACTED] D [REDACTED] T; EMAILS RE SAME; EXCHANGE EMAIL W/ ATTY BROWN RE [REDACTED] T/CONF [REDACTED]; FOLLOW-UP EMAIL; EXCHANGE EMAIL W/ MR. CRON RE [REDACTED]; T/CONF RE SAME PARTNER: JASON M. ACKERMAN	7.20
06/03/14	RESEARCH FOR [REDACTED] D [REDACTED] CLERK: MARC TRAN	1.70
06/03/14	WORK WITH ATTY BROWN TO PREPARE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: KRYSTEN STEELE	0.40

*Privileged and Confidential*

Indian Wells  
(760) 568-2611  
Irvine  
(949) 263-2600  
Los Angeles  
(213) 617-8100  
Ontario  
(809) 989-8584



**BEST BEST & KRIEGER**  
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502  
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com  
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Sacramento  
(916) 325-4000  
San Diego  
(619) 525-1300  
Walnut Creek  
(925) 977-3300  
Washington DC  
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.0201A  
Re: APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER COMPANY

July 18, 2014  
Invoice 730100  
Page 3

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
06/03/14	PREPARE [REDACTED]; EMAIL W/ MR. JACKSON RE SAME PARALEGAL: TAMMY L. INGRAM	0.50
06/04/14	BEGIN PREPARATION FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] E [REDACTED] PARTNER: JOHN E. BROWN	0.40
06/04/14	INTRA O/CONF RE [REDACTED]; INTRA O/CONF RE [REDACTED] L [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	0.40
06/04/14	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN [REDACTED]; T/CONFS W/ MR. CRON RE SAME; T/CONF W/ MR. RUBIN; REVIEW AND ANALYZE [REDACTED]; CIRCULATE SAME; [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: JASON M. ACKERMAN	6.70
06/04/14	RESEARCH FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CLERK: MARC TRAN	1.80
06/05/14	REVIEW E-MAILS FROM MR. CRON [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; COMPOSE, SEND AND EXCHANGE NUMEROUS E-MAILS TO MESSRS. CRON AND PUCKETT AND ROBINSON RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: JOHN E. BROWN	1.60
06/05/14	RESEARCH FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CLERK: MARC TRAN	2.00
06/05/14	DRAFT MEMO RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CLERK: MARC TRAN	0.60
06/05/14	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN [REDACTED]; T/CONFS W/ MR. CRON RE SAME; EXCHANGE EMAILS W/ ATTYS SALT AND BROWN RE [REDACTED]; WORK ON [REDACTED] [REDACTED] S; [REDACTED] PARTNER: JASON M. ACKERMAN	7.70

Indian Wells  
(760) 568-2611  
Irvine  
(949) 263-2600  
Los Angeles  
(213) 617-9100  
Ontario  
(909) 889-8584



**BEST BEST & KRIEGER**  
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502  
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com  
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Sacramento  
(916) 325-4000  
San Diego  
(619) 525-1300  
Walnut Creek  
(925) 977-3300  
Washington DC  
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.0201A  
Re: APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER COMPANY

July 18, 2014  
Invoice 730100  
Page 4

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
06/05/14	MEETING W/ SUMMER ASSOCIATE TRAN RE [REDACTED] Y [REDACTED]; REVIEW AND EDIT [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ASSOCIATE 2: CAMBRIA SMITH	0.60
06/06/14	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN [REDACTED]; T/CONFS W/ MR. CRON RE SAME; [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CIRCULATE SAME; RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF [REDACTED]; CIRCULATE SAME; [REDACTED]; EXCHANGE EMAIL W/ MR. RUBIN RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: JASON M. ACKERMAN	6.20
06/06/14	MEETING W/ SUMMER ASSOCIATE TRAN [REDACTED] [REDACTED] M; REVIEW AND EDIT [REDACTED]; CORRESP W/ ATTYS ACKERMAN, BROWN RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ASSOCIATE 2: CAMBRIA SMITH	0.50
06/06/14	RESEARCH FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EDIT [REDACTED] CLERK: MARC TRAN	0.80
06/09/14	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN [REDACTED]; EXCHANGE EMAILS W/ MR. CRON PARTNER: JASON M. ACKERMAN	2.10
06/09/14	DISCUSS [REDACTED] WITH ATTY BROWN; REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ASSOCIATE 2: THOMAS RICE	0.40
06/09/14	PREPARE [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: KRYSTEN STEELE	1.20
06/09/14	RESEARCH RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] RESEARCH ANALYS: MARK GEDIMAN	0.10
06/10/14	REVIEW OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: PIERO C. DALLARDA	0.50

Indian Wells  
(760) 568-2611  
Irvine  
(949) 283-2600  
Los Angeles  
(213) 617-8100  
Ontario  
(909) 989-8584



**BEST BEST & KRIEGER**  
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502  
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com  
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Sacramento  
(916) 325-4000  
San Diego  
(619) 525-1300  
Walnut Creek  
(925) 977-3300  
Washington DC  
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.0201A  
Re: APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER COMPANY

July 18, 2014  
Invoice 730100  
Page 5

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
06/10/14	REVISE AND PREPARE [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED]; ASSIGN [REDACTED] [REDACTED] - EXPLAIN [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; RESEARCH RE [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVISE CLIENT MEMO RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] AND REVISE [REDACTED] D [REDACTED]; DRAFT EMAIL TO LAW CLERK TRAN RE SAME ASSOCIATE 2: THOMAS RICE	4.40
06/10/14	O/CONF W/ ATTY RICE RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CLERK: MARC TRAN	0.70
06/11/14	REVIEW OF [REDACTED] PARTNER: PIERO C. DALLARDA	0.30
06/30/14	INTRA O/CONF RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	0.20
07/11/14	REVISE AND FINALIZE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CLERK: MATTHEW COLLINS	0.40

**Summary of Fees:**

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hr</u>	<u>Amount</u>
JOHN E. BROWN	PARTNER	3.70	301.00	1,113.70
KENDALL H. MACVEY	PARTNER	2.50	301.00	752.50
PIERO C. DALLARDA	PARTNER	2.40	301.00	722.40
JASON M. ACKERMAN	PARTNER	39.40	301.00	11,859.40
CAMBRIA SMITH	ASSOCIATE 2	1.10	248.00	272.80
THOMAS RICE	ASSOCIATE 2	4.80	248.00	1,190.40
MARK GEDIMAN	RESEARCH ANALYS	0.10	137.00	13.70
MATTHEW COLLINS	CLERK	0.40	161.00	64.40
MARC TRAN	CLERK	7.60	158.00	1,200.80
KRYSTEN STEELE	PARALEGAL	1.60	158.00	252.80
TAMMY L. INGRAM	PARALEGAL	0.50	158.00	79.00

Total Hours: 64.10

Total Fees for Professional Services \$ 17,521.90

*Privileged and Confidential*

Indian Wells  
(760) 568-2611  
Irvine  
(949) 263-2600  
Los Angeles  
(213) 617-8100  
Ontario  
(909) 989-8584



**BEST BEST & KRIEGER**  
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502  
Phone: (951) 886-1450 | Fax: (951) 886-3083 | www.bbklaw.com  
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Sacramento  
(916) 325-4000  
San Diego  
(619) 525-1300  
Walnut Creek  
(925) 877-3300  
Washington DC  
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.0201A  
Re: APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER COMPANY

July 18, 2014  
Invoice 730100  
Page 6

**Reimbursable Costs:**

**DEPOSITION**

06/17/14	DEPOSITION - PUBLIC UTILITIES COMMISSION (JMA)	696.00
	SUBTOTAL:	696.00

**LOCAL TRAVEL**

06/15/14	TAXI/CAR SERVICE, SAN FRANCISCO FROM OAKLAND, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS, 06/15/2014, JASON M. ACKERMAN	81.50
06/16/14	TAXI/CAR SERVICE, SAN FRANCISCO, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS, 06/16/2014, JASON M. ACKERMAN	6.79
06/16/14	TAXI/CAR SERVICE, SAN FRANCISCO, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS, 06/16/2014, JASON M. ACKERMAN	10.00
06/17/14	TAXI/CAR SERVICE, HOTEL FROM CPUC, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS, 06/17/2014, JASON M. ACKERMAN	8.77
06/17/14	TAXI/CAR SERVICE, DINNER FROM HOTEL, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS, 06/17/2014, JASON M. ACKERMAN	9.82
06/17/14	TIPS, JW MARRIOTT, HOTEL BELLMAN, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS, 06/17/2014, JASON M. ACKERMAN	20.00
06/17/14	PARKING, ONTARIO INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS, 06/17/2014, JASON M. ACKERMAN	54.00
06/17/14	TAXI/CAR SERVICE, OAKLAND FROM SAN FRANCISCO, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS, 06/17/2014, JASON M. ACKERMAN	90.00
06/17/14	HOTEL - SAN FRANCISCO, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS, 06/17/2014, JASON M. ACKERMAN	1,072.74
	SUBTOTAL:	1,353.62

**MEALS**

06/16/14	BREAKFAST, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS, 06/16/2014, JASON M. ACKERMAN	2.00
06/16/14	COFFEE, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS, 06/16/2014, JASON M. ACKERMAN	2.00
06/16/14	WATER, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS, 06/16/2014, JASON M. ACKERMAN	2.75
06/16/14	LUNCH, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS, 06/16/2014, JASON M. ACKERMAN	22.15
06/16/14	DINNER, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS, 06/16/2014, JASON M. ACKERMAN	35.32

Indian Wells  
(760) 588-2611  
Irvine  
(949) 263-2600  
Los Angeles  
(213) 617-8100  
Ontario  
(909) 889-8584



**BEST BEST & KRIEGER**  
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502  
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com  
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Sacramento  
(916) 325-4000  
San Diego  
(619) 525-1300  
Walnut Creek  
(925) 977-3300  
Washington DC  
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.0201A  
Re: APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER COMPANY

July 18, 2014  
Invoice 730100  
Page 7

---

06/17/14	WATER, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS, 06/17/2014, JASON M. ACKERMAN	1.75
06/17/14	BREAKFAST, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS, 06/17/2014, JASON M. ACKERMAN	5.25
06/17/14	DINNER, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS, 06/17/2014, JASON M. ACKERMAN	17.70
06/17/14	LUNCH, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS, 06/17/2014, JASON M. ACKERMAN	50.98
	SUBTOTAL:	139.90
MISCELLANEOUS		
05/30/14	CONFERENCE CALLS - SOUNDPATH LEGAL CONFERENCING (JB)	3.22
	SUBTOTAL:	3.22
OUTSIDE COUNSEL		
05/30/14	PROFESSIONAL OUTSIDE COUNSEL SERVICES RENDERED APRIL THROUGH MAY 2014 - SCOTT J. RUBIN (JMA)	4,250.00
06/16/14	PROFESSIONAL COUNSEL SERVICES RENDERED JUNE 2014 - SCOTT J. RUBIN (JMA)	2,326.00
	SUBTOTAL:	6,576.00
OUTSIDE PRINTING		
06/15/14	DUPLICATING, ELEVEN WIRELESS, PRINTING OF COPIES/EXHIBITS, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS, 06/15/2014, JASON M. ACKERMAN	43.57
	SUBTOTAL:	43.57
SHIPPING		
06/03/14	SHIPPING	12.15
	SUBTOTAL:	12.15
06/30/14	PRINT COST	54.06
06/30/14	COLOR COPIES	3.40

**Total Reimbursable Costs \$ 8,881.92**

**Total Current Billings For This Matter: \$ 26,403.82**

*Privileged and Confidential*